

	Tidewater, Inc.		Water Testing Labs of MD, Inc.		KCI	
<u>CONSULTANT LABOR RATES:</u>		<u>Regular Hours</u>		<u>Regular Hours</u>		<u>Regular Hours</u>
Sample Analysis	Not to Exceed	\$12.50 /per sample	Not to Exceed	\$12.85 /per sample	Not to Exceed	\$6.00 /per sample
Certified Sample Collector	Not to Exceed	\$50.00 /man-hour	Not to Exceed	\$85.00 /man-hour	Not to Exceed	\$70.00 /man-hour
Analysis Report	Not to Exceed	\$350.00 /per school	Not to Exceed	\$0.00 /per school	Not to Exceed	\$250.00 /per school
		<u>Premium Hours</u>		<u>Premium Hours</u>		<u>Premium Hours</u>
	Not to Exceed	\$70.00 /man-hour	Not to Exceed	\$125.00 /man-hour	Not to Exceed	\$85.00 /man-hour
<u>LABORATORY - UNIT PRICES</u>						
Sample Analysis	Not to Exceed	\$12.50 /per sample	Not to Exceed	\$12.85 /per sample	Not to Exceed	\$6.00 /per sample
Courier Fee	Not to Exceed	\$125.00 /per pickup and drop-off of samples to be analyzed	Not to Exceed	\$50.00 /per pickup and drop-off of samples to be analyzed	Not to Exceed	\$300.00 /per pickup and drop-off of samples to be analyzed

	Aria Environmental, Inc.		CWM Environmental		Martel Laboratories JDS Inc.	
<u>CONSULTANT LABOR RATES:</u>		<u>Regular Hours</u>		<u>Regular Hours</u>		<u>Regular Hours</u>
Sample Analysis	Not to Exceed	\$12.50 /per sample	Not to Exceed	\$65.00 /per sample	Not to Exceed	\$20.00 /per sample
Certified Sample Collector	Not to Exceed	\$67.50 /man-hour	Not to Exceed	\$100.00 /man-hour	Not to Exceed	\$90.00 /man-hour
Analysis Report	Not to Exceed	\$275.00 /per school	Not to Exceed	\$200.00 /per school	Not to Exceed	\$0.00 /per school
		<u>Premium Hours</u>		<u>Premium Hours</u>		<u>Premium Hours</u>
	Not to Exceed	\$100.00 /man-hour	Not to Exceed	\$100.00 /man-hour	Not to Exceed	\$135.00 /man-hour
<u>LABORATORY - UNIT PRICES</u>						
Sample Analysis	Not to Exceed	No Bid /per sample	Not to Exceed	\$35.00 /per sample	Not to Exceed	\$20.00 /per sample
Courier Fee	Not to Exceed	No Bid /per pickup and drop-off of samples to be analyzed	Not to Exceed	\$20.00 /per pickup and drop-off of samples to be analyzed	Not to Exceed	\$25.00 /per pickup and drop-off of samples to be analyzed

	Enviro-Chem Laboratories, Inc.	Soil And Land Use Technology, Inc.	Batta Environmental
<u>CONSULTANT LABOR RATES:</u>	<u>Regular Hours</u>	<u>Regular Hours</u>	<u>Regular Hours</u>
Sample Analysis	Not to Exceed <u> \$14.00 </u> /per sample	Not to Exceed <u> \$13.50 </u> /per sample	Not to Exceed <u> N/A </u> /per sample
Certified Sample Collector	Not to Exceed <u> \$40.00 </u> /man-hour	Not to Exceed <u> \$40.00 </u> /man-hour	Not to Exceed <u> \$67.50 </u> /man-hour
Analysis Report	Not to Exceed <u> \$10.00 </u> /per school	Not to Exceed <u> \$125.00 </u> /per school	Not to Exceed <u> \$350.00 </u> /per school
	<u>Premium Hours</u>	<u>Premium Hours</u>	<u>Premium Hours</u>
	Not to Exceed <u> \$40.00 </u> /man-hour	Not to Exceed <u> \$55.00 </u> /man-hour	Not to Exceed <u> \$67.50 </u> /man-hour
<u>LABORATORY - UNIT PRICES</u>			
Sample Analysis	Not to Exceed <u> \$12.00 </u> /per sample	Not to Exceed <u> \$13.50 </u> /per sample	Not to Exceed <u> \$12.00 </u> /per sample
Courier Fee	Not to Exceed <u> \$35.00 </u> /per pickup and drop-off of samples to be analyzed	Not to Exceed <u> \$80.00 </u> /per pickup and drop-off of samples to be analyzed	Not to Exceed <u> \$150.00 </u> /per pickup and drop-off of samples to be analyzed

	Triad Engineering, Inc.	Maryland Spectral Services, Inc.	Froehling & Robertson, Inc.
<u>CONSULTANT LABOR RATES:</u>	<u>Regular Hours</u>	<u>Regular Hours</u>	<u>Regular Hours</u>
Sample Analysis	Not to Exceed <u> N/A </u> /per sample	Not to Exceed <u> N/A </u> /per sample	Not to Exceed <u> \$7.00 </u> /per sample
Certified Sample Collector	Not to Exceed <u> \$75.00 </u> /man-hour	Not to Exceed <u> N/A </u> /man-hour	Not to Exceed <u> \$65.00 </u> /man-hour
Analysis Report	Not to Exceed <u> \$500.00 </u> /per school	Not to Exceed <u> N/A </u> /per school	Not to Exceed <u> \$300.00 </u> /per school
	<u>Premium Hours</u>	<u>Premium Hours</u>	<u>Premium Hours</u>
	Not to Exceed <u> \$112.50 </u> /man-hour	Not to Exceed <u> N/A </u> /man-hour	Not to Exceed <u> \$85.00 </u> /man-hour
<u>LABORATORY - UNIT PRICES</u>			
Sample Analysis	Not to Exceed <u> \$12.65 </u> /per sample	Not to Exceed <u> \$12.00 </u> /per sample	Not to Exceed <u> \$7.50 </u> /per sample
Courier Fee	Not to Exceed <u> \$56.35 </u> /per pickup and drop-off of samples to be analyzed	Not to Exceed <u> \$35.00 </u> /per pickup and drop-off of samples to be analyzed	Not to Exceed <u> \$25.00 </u> /per pickup and drop-off of samples to be analyzed

	Global Consulting, Inc.	AMA Analytical Services, Inc.	Professional Service Industries, Inc.
<u>CONSULTANT LABOR RATES:</u>	<u>Regular Hours</u>	<u>Regular Hours</u>	<u>Regular Hours</u>
Sample Analysis	Not to Exceed <u> \$10.00 </u> /per sample	Not to Exceed <u> No Bid </u> /per sample	Not to Exceed <u> \$24.50 </u> /per sample
Certified Sample Collector	Not to Exceed <u> \$37.00 </u> /man-hour	Not to Exceed <u> No Bid </u> /man-hour	Not to Exceed <u> \$65.00 </u> /man-hour
Analysis Report	Not to Exceed <u> \$0.00 </u> /per school	Not to Exceed <u> No Bid </u> /per school	Not to Exceed <u> \$485.00 </u> /per school
	<u>Premium Hours</u>	<u>Premium Hours</u>	<u>Premium Hours</u>
	Not to Exceed <u> \$37.00 </u> /man-hour	Not to Exceed <u> No Bid </u> /man-hour	Not to Exceed <u> \$72.00 </u> /man-hour
<u>LABORATORY - UNIT PRICES</u>			
Sample Analysis	Not to Exceed <u> N/A </u> /per sample	Not to Exceed <u> \$9.99 </u> /per sample	Not to Exceed <u> \$12.00 </u> /per sample
Courier Fee	Not to Exceed <u> N/A </u> /per pickup and drop-off of samples to be analyzed	Not to Exceed <u> \$0.00 </u> /per pickup and drop-off of samples to be analyzed	Not to Exceed <u> \$0.00 </u> /per pickup and drop-off of samples to be analyzed