

Bid Tab
Bid #076.18.B3
Kitchen Equipment

6/5/2018
11:01 AM

		Douglas Equipment	Business Services	BHS Food Service Solutions, LLC	Carey Sales and Services	Ashland Equipment
Item #	Product Description	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
1	Convection Oven (Double) Manufacturer - Blodgett Model Number: HV 100E	\$21,380.38	No Bid	\$25,801.41	\$22,731.58	\$19,564.00
2	Dishwasher Manufacturer: Hobart Model Number: AM15VLT-4	\$21,190.28	No Bid	\$22,801.43	No Bid	\$21,491.00
3	Milk Cooler Manufacturer: Beverage Air Model Number: SM34N-S	\$2,724.59	\$2,429.28	\$1,987.10	\$2,575.00	\$2,048.00
4	Milk Cooler Manufacturer: Beverage Air Model Number: SM49N-S	\$2,240.31	\$2,699.98	\$2,272.88	\$2,937.67	\$2,342.00
5	Washing Machine Manufacturer - General Electric Model Number: GCWP1000MWW	\$1,939.85	\$698.98	\$788.69	No Bid	\$5,541.00
6	2-Door Freezer Manufacturer: Traulsen Model Number: G22110	\$4,883.60	\$6,249.98	\$5,201.48	\$7,991.87	\$4,787.00
7	Reach In Refrigerator Manufacturer - Traulsen Model Number: AHT232WUT-HHS	\$10,191.26	\$11,939.98	\$11,089.89	\$8,082.28	\$9,399.00
8	Walk In Freezer Manufacturer: Norlake Model Number: KLX68-C	\$12,059.90	No Bid	\$10,746.43	No Bid	\$10,722.00
9	3 Section Half Door Reach In Refrigerator Manufacturer - Traulsen Model Number: AHT332WUT-HHS	\$15,038.43	\$16,599.98	\$15,179.27	\$11,726.49	\$12,740.00
10	Walk-In Freezer Condensing Unit & Evaporator Coil Manufacturer: Model Number - Condensing Unit: TEHA025L6HT3CF Model Number - Evaporator Coil: TPLP209LES2BR6 EC2	\$6,307.51	No Bid	\$4,422.66	No Bid	\$6,000.00