BID TABULATION

Howard County Public Schools
Procurement Office

10910 Clarksville Pike

Ellicott City, MD 21042

Football Helmets

BID #045.18.B4

Bid Opening Date and Time Purchasing Agent Recorded By
April 24, 2018 at 10:00 AM Bob Gill Cece Clement

PRODUCT BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

Sportsman Riddell Gopher Schutt Sport

Sport
Schutt — Vengeance Z10 261.85 No Bid 264.60 299.95
Schutt — Vengeance VTD 11 236.45 No Bid 208.15 199.95
Schutt - Air XP Pro VTD |l 228.65 No Bid 211.46 200.00
Schutt — Vengeance Pro 223.65 No Bid 199.91 169.95
Schutt - F7 VTD 574.50 No Bid No Bid 450.00
Riddell — Speed Icon No Bid 325.00 No Bid No Bid
Riddell — Revolution Speed No Bid 250.00 No Bid No Bid
Riddell - Revolution No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Riddell - Speedflex No Bid 385.00 No Bid No Bid
Custom Colors — (Unit price per 21.45 12.25t0 45.25 Project by No Charge
helmet) Project

Basis
Custom Design — (Unit price 38.50 22.501099.50 | Project by 25.00
per helmet) Project

Basis

NOTE: This Bid Tabulation is only a statement of pricing and does not reflect bid evaluation or award.
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