Bid Tab 9/12/2014
Bid #011.15.B3 11:01 PM
Domestic Water Heater Replacements
Centennial and Hammond High Schools

Total Base Bid Alternate 1 Total Base Bid Alternate 1

Company Centennial HS Centennial HS Hammond HS Hammondl HS
Temp Air Company, Inc. $142,266.00 $75,034.00 $117,845.00 $75,790.00
M & E Sales, Inc. No Bid No Bid $188,809.00 $68,761.00
Pro-Air $179,480.00 $65,960.00 $148,230.00 $71,150.00
Denver-Elek, Inc. $163,800.00 $65,700.00 $136,600.00 $66,300.00
Protec Construction, Inc. $184,561.00 $42,267.00 No Bid No Bid
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