GLOVER FURNITURE PRICING

EFFECTIVE 1/1/13 - 12/31113

PRICES MUST INCLUDE INSIDE DELIVERY & SET-UP

ltem Model Price INSTALL CHRG
Art Stool, Fixed Height - 18" Kreuger 618 49.50
Art Stool, Adj. 18-26" Kreuger 618A $57.10
Art Stool, Adj. 19-32" Royal Seating Allegiance #627024N (#1500) $76.25
Bench, Wood with Arms, Small (48") Community 991A $1,394.50
Bench, Wood with Arms, Large (68") Community 993A $1,558.60
Book Cart, double-sided, 6-shelf (36x18x43H) Smith System 21001 $355.90
Book Cart, single-sided, 3-shelf Smith System 21092 $292.00
Bookcase, metal, 3-shelf, 42" (42x12x36) Lee Metal BR42C (BA20) $133.00
Bookcase, metal, 4-shelf, 52" (52x12x386) Lee Metal BR52C (BA30) $156.00
Bookcase, metal, Z shelf (29" x 12" x 36") Lee Metai BR29 (BA10) $129.00
Bulletin Board, 4 x 4 Claridge 844N $174.50 $30.00
Bulletin Board, 4 x 5 Claridge 959A $203.05 $30.00
Bulletin Board, 4 x6 Claridge 852N $215.90 $40.00
Bulletin Board, 4 x 8 Claridge 858N $265.75 $40.00
Bulletin Board, 4 x 10 Claridge 862N $304.50 $45.00
Bulletin Board, 4 x 12 Claridge 864N $337.80 $50.00
Bulletin Board, 4 x 16 Claridge 866N $393.85 $50.00
Bulletin Board, Portable, magnetic, Green, 4 x 6 Claridge Vitracite #60V wicasters add one $812.00 $80.00
Bulletin Board, Portable, magnetic, Black, 4 x6 Claridge Vitracite #62V w/casters add one $812.00 $40.00
Bulletin Board, Portable, magnetic, Green, 42" x 60" Claridge Vitracite #61V w/casters add one $724.00 $40.00
Bulletin Board, Portable, magnetic, Black, 42" x 60" Claridge Vitracite #63V wicasters add one $724.00 $40.00
Bulletin Board, Portable, magnetic, Green, 3 x 4' Claridge Vitracite #50V w/casters add one $609.00 $30.00
Bulletin Board, Portable, magnetic, Black, 3 x 4' Claridge Vitracite #52V w/casters add one $609.00 $30.00
Cabinet, Storage, Combination (1/2 storage, 1/2 cabinet) Lee Metal 8118W (CAC1) $334.00
Cabhinet, Storage, w/lock, 72x36x18 Lee Metal 8036C (CA 41) $295.00
Cabinet, Storage, wilock, 78x36x24D Lee Metal 8208C (CA 41) $384.00
Carrell, with adj. Legs (36x24x22-29"H) Artco Bell 1321 $310.70
Chair, Folding Tablet, right handed folding tablet, metal chair Krueger 701FTAR $116.90
Chair, Folding Krueger 701 $41.60
Chair Truck, holds 50 folding chairs Krueger KV50 - Beige $391.60
Chair Truck, double-tier, holds 84 chairs Krueger KDT84 - Beige $999.80
Chair, Folding, with padded seat & back Virco 168 No Bid
Chair, Folding, metal, beige (52-Gray) National Public Seating #51 $15.95
Chair, Folding, metal, beige (52-Gray) PRICE FOR 500+ National Public Seating #51 $15.95
Folding Chair Caddy, holds 84 chairs National Public Seating #84 $242.80
Chair, Music, 16-1/2", stackable Columbia 1286 $49.10

Chair, Music, 17-1/2", stackable

Columbia 1287

$50.10




Item Model Price INSTALL CHRG
Chair, Music, 18-1/2", stackable Columbia 1289 $50.60
Chair Handtruck for Music Chairs, stacks up to 10 chairs Columbia 0010X $83.25
Chair Truck, holds 53 folding chairs Virco CT10 No Bid
Chair Truck, double-tier, holds 84 chairs Virco CT6072 No Bid
Chair, Student, 11-1/2", Soft Plastic Artco Bell 7101 $23.10
Chair, Student, 13-1/2" " Artco Bell 7103 $23.10
Chair, Student, 15-1/2" " Artco Bell 7105 $27.60
Chair, Student, 17-1/2" " Artco Bell 7107 $29.75
Chair, Student, 18-1/2" (Oversize), Soft Plastic Artco Bell 7108 $34.10
Chair Truck for Stackable Chairs, 4-wheel, holds 10-15 chairs Artco Bell 0168 $68.30
Chair Truck for Stackable Chairs, 2-wheel, holds 10 chairs (tili-back) Arcto Bell 0160 $87.70
Chair, Student, 13-1/2", Soft Plastic, Sled Base Artco Bell 7003 $29.75
Chair, Student, 15-1/2" " " Artco Bell 7005 $33.60
Chair, Student, 17-1/2" " " Arico Bell 7007 $35.50
Chair, Student, 12", Soft Plastic Artco Bell D10D (Discover) $22.80
Chair, Student, 14", Soft Plastic Artco Bell D10C (Discover) $22.80
Chair, Student, 16, Soft Plastic Artco Bell D10B (Discover) $26.75
Chair, Student, 18", Soft Plastic Artco Bell D10A (Discover) $29.90
Chair, Student, 18"A+, Soit Plastic Artco Bell D10X (Discover) $34.30
Chair, Student {Extra Large), Soft Plastic Columbia 1268 $41.60
Chair, Student, 13", Soft Plastic, |Q (Ergonomic) Columbia 1263 ERGO $35.70
Chair, Student, 15", " " " Columbia 1265 ERGO $36.25
Chair, Student, 17-1/2" " " Columbia 1267 ERGO $38.10
Chair, Student, 12", Hard Plastic Columbia 112-2 $53.50
Chair, Student, 13-1/2", " Columbia 112-3 $54.40
Chair, Student, 15-1/2", " Columbia 112-5 $55.00
Chair, Student, 17-1/2", " Columbia 112-7 $56.20
Chair, Student, Hard Plastic, Adjustable legs Columbia 113 $59.15
Chair, Student, 12", Hard Plastic, with "X" Brace Columbia 152-2 $54.85
Chair, Student, 13-1/2", " " Columbia 152-3 $55.25
Chair, Student, 15-1/2", " " Columbia 152-5 $56.10
Chair, Student, 17-1/2", " " Columbia 152-7 $57.40
Chair, Student, 17-1/2, Hard Plastic w/bookrack & casters (computer lab) Columbia 2327 $78.90
Chair, Student, 12", Soft Plastic Columbia 126-2 $35.00
Chair, Teacher, 17-1/2 with upholstery and NO arms Columbia 426-7 $67.90
Chair, Teacher, Soft Plastic with pads, NO arms Artco Bell 7167 $103.50
Chair, Teacher, " ", with arms, pads & casters Artco Bell 71687 $129.95
Chair, Teacher, Task Style, w/o arms Hon 7901 $168.10
Chair, Teacher, Task Style, with arms (either 7991 or 7992 arms) Hon 7901 $182.20
Chair, Teacher, Task Style, w/o arms Global 2312 $168.50
Chair, Teacher, Task Style, w/ loop arms Global 2313 $200.20
Chair, Teacher, Task Style, w/o arms United NS-1 $174.30
~1Chair, Teacher, with aims United NS-2 $191.20
Chalkboard, 3 x 5 Non-magnetic Best-Rite 101AE $173.00 $30.00




Item Model Price INSTALL CHRG
Chalkboard, 4 x 4 , Non-magnetic Best-Rite 101AD $194.00 $30.00
Chalkboard, 4 x5 Non-magnetic Best-Rite 101AF $209.00 $30.00
Chalkboard, 4 x6 Non-magnatic Best-Rite 101AG $246.00 $30.00
Chalkboard, 4 x 8 Non-magnetic Best-Rite 101AH $348.00 $40.00
Chalkboard, 4 x 10 Non-magntic Best-Rite 101AK $422.00 $45.00
Chalkboard, 4 x 12 Non-magnetic Best-Rite 101AM $491.00 $50.00
Chalkboard, 42" x 98", Magnetic Best-Rite 104AH-CUT $535.00 $40.00
Chalkboard, 4 x 4 , Magnetic (Green standard; Specify #13 Black for black) Claridge 818V $328.30 $30.00
Chalkboard, 4 x 6, Magnetic Claridge 822V $436.00 $40.00
Chalkboard, 4 x 8 , Magnetic Claridge 826V $488.75 $40.00
Chalkboard, 4 x § , Magnetic BR104AH $468.00 $40.00
Chalkboard, 4 x 10, Magnetic Claridge 830V $641.90 $45.00
Chalkboard, 4 x 12, Magnetic Claridge 834V $718.00 $50.00
Chalkboard, 4 x 16, Magnetic Claridge 838V $882.00 $50.00
Chalkboard cork strips, 1" wide, price per linear foot Claridge 51 $4.15
Chalkboard cork strips, 2" wide, " " " " Claridge 74 $6.90
Cork Strip End Stop (for above) 51ES (Claridge) $2.10
Chalkboard, portable, wood frame, 4 x 6' Claridge D2GV + 2 casters $815.00
Chalkboard, portable, aluminum frame, 4 x &' Claridge 60V + 2 casters $310.00
Computer Table, Balt WOW-TR $233.90
Computer Table, 30 x 60, adj. Legs Arico Bell ABCD60 $431.20
Wire Management Tray for above WMT-5 {Artco Bell) $32.80
CPU Holder for above CPU-1 (Artco Bell) $82.15
Computer Table, 30x60 $205.10
Computer Table, 30x72 $222.25
Keyboard platform for above $146.50
4" Heavy Duty Casters $32.50
Surge Protector No Bid
Desk, Student, No Box, laminate top, adj. legs Artco Bell 9100 $52.40
Desk, Student, Bookbox, laminate top, adj. Legs Artco Bell 9500 $56.75
Desk, Student, Bookbox, adj. Legs Arico Bell DAOD (D|scover) $51.20
Desk, Student, Handicpped (20" x 36") Artco Bell 2900 $86.50
Desk, Student, Oversize (20" x 26), No Bookbox Artco Bell 9106 $63.10
Desk, Student, Hard Plastic Top, No Book Box, Adjust. Leg Columbia 711 $72.80
Desk, Student, Hard Plastic Top, with Book Box, Fixed Legs, 22-1/2" Columbia 311-2 $78.40
Desk, Student, " tonon " "o23-1/2" Columbia 311-3 $78.40
Desk, Studept, " " "~ = * »*® " " 26-1/2" Columbia 311-6 $79.20
Desk, Stugent, = =~ = = = =n " "o29-1/2" Columbia 311-9 $80.50
Desk, Student, Hard Plastic Top & Book Box, Adj. Legs, 22-30" Columbia 313 $82.65
Desk, Student, Hard Plastic Top & Wire Basket w/specflec coated iegs Columbia 377 $91.55
Desk, Student, Hard Plastic Top & Wire Basket w/chrome legs Columbia 377 $92.10
Desk, Student, Hard Plastic Top, NO BASKET, w/coated legs Columbia 711-9 $71.25
Desk, Student, Hard Plastic Top, Wheelchair accessible, 32" fixed of adj: ht. Columbia 5060 $90.10
Desk, with Tablet Arm with Bookrack Columbia §727 $112.75
KI 7015TAR (701 FTAR) $133.10

Desk, Tablet Arm (movable), Miracle Fold (Beige or Gray)




Item Model Price INSTALL CHRG
Desk, Teacher, 30 x 48, Single Pedestal & Center Drawer Adelphia 48S with center drawer $428.60
Desk, Teacher, 30 x 680, Double Pedestal & Center Drawer Adelphia 3060DP/CD $539.50
Dry Erase Board, Magnetic, 4 x 8 (includes installation) Claridge LCS2048 $492.00
File Cabinet, 2-drawer vertical, letter w lock, 28-1/2" D Adelphia 402L $227.00
File Cabinet, 4-drawer vertcal, letter wilock, 28-1/2" D Adelphia 404L $297.00
File Cabinet, S-drawer vertical, letter, w/lock, 28-1/2" D Adelphia 405L $350.00
File Cabinet, 4-drawer vertical, LEGAL, with lock Adelphia 414L $333.00
File Cabinet, 4-drawer lateral with drawers, letter Anderson Hickey L442 (Global 9342-4F1H) $529.00
Flat File (Poster), 49W x 29D x 36H, 5-Drawer Lee Metal 9558 $760.00
Rocking Chair Holbrook HT08671 $293.90
Stool, Adjustable 18-27" KI618A $57.10
Stool, Adjustable 18-27" National Public Seating 6224H $39.00
Stool, Fixed height of 24" National Public Seating 6224 $29.00
Stool, Fixed height of 30" National Public Seating 6230 $36.00
Table, Art, Student Pedestal, 42 x 60 Shain Shop Bilt PT61M $735.00
Table, Cafeteria (Bench Style), 12' Benches Palmer Snyder Model #63T09293012 $1,261.30
Table, Cafeteria, Bench, 12' Virco MTB172912 No Bid
Table, Cafeteria, Stool, 12' Palmer Snyder 59M293012-S12 (1-9 tables) $1,440.00
Table, Cafeteria - 60" Round or Oclagon, folding, on casters Palmer Snyder 22F29800C $633.25
Table, Cafeteria, 12' with Benches Sico TBC 13F $1,495.00
Table, Cafeteria, 12' with Benches BioFit 12FB29 $1,475.00
Table, Folding, Lightweight, Plastic, Beige/Dark Oak, 30 x 96" Palmer Snyder B3096SW $358.45
Table, Round, with 4 book boxes Allied F560CR & 4BB1 $346.60
Table, Science, 48 x 24" Chemsurf (Black) Top - Top Only $285.00
Tabie, Scierce, 24 x 54", wood base with Chemsurf resistant laminate top BS2454A (Allied) $440.70
Table, Science, 30 x60, " " {+"BB" &add $35 for 2 book compartments) BS3060A $463.25
Table, Student Activity, 24 x 48, adj. Legs Allied F52448 $95.00
Table, Student Activity, 30 x 60, adj. Legs Allied F53060 $122.00
Table, Student Activity, 30 x 60, adj. Legs, Gray top & color sides Allied F63060 $122.00
Table, Student Activity, 36 x 60, ad]. Legs Allied F53660 $137.00
Table, Student Activity, 30 x 72, adj Legs Allied F53072 $137.00
Table, Student Activity, 36 x 72, adj. Legs Allied F53672 $139.00
Table, Student Activity, 36 x 96, adj. Legs Allied F53696 $225.00
Table, Student Activity, 36" Round Allied F536CR $115.00
Table, Student Activity, 42" Round Allied F542CR $118.00
Table, Student Activity, 48" Round Allied F548CR $145.00
Table, Student Activity, Octagon, 48" Allied F5480T $149.00
Table, Folding, 18 x 80" (Laminates: Walnut/Lt. Oak/Teak/Birch) Allied 121860 $109.00
Table, Folding, 30 x 72" Allied 123072 $129.00
Table, Kidney Allied F5472 $232.70
Table, Horseshoe, 80 x 68, adj. Legs Allied F5666H" $269.00
Table, Trapezoid, 30x30x60 Allied F530TP $131.20
Whiteboard, 2 x 3, Magnetic Claridge LCS2023 $113.90 $30.00
Whiteboard, 3 x 4, Magnetic Claridge 814L $281.05 $30.00
Claridge 818L $343.10 $30.00

Whiteboard, 4 x 4, Magnetic




Item Model Price INSTALL CHRG
Whiteboard, 4 x 5, Magnetic Claridge 8221 Modified $419.00 $40.00
Whiteboard, 4 x 6, Magnetic Claridge 8221 $419.00 $40.00
Whiteboard, 4 x 8, Magnetic Claridge 826L $495.00 $40.00
Whiteboard, 4 x 8 White melamine, NOT magnetic, Claridge MLC2048R $371.20 $40.00
Whiteboard, 4 x 6, on casters, magnetized, reversible board (Add 1) Claridge LCS56 with casters (LCS59) $783.00
Whiteboard, 4 x 6, on casters, both sides magnetized , chalk & whiteboard Claridge LCS56 {modified) (LCS559) $996.25
Whiteboard, 4 x 6, on casters, magnetized, with Music Lines Claridge LCS56 with Casters & Music Lines $1,081.90
Whiteboard, 4 x 6, on casters, NOT magnetized Claridge MLC56 with casters add one $615.00
Whiteboard, 4 x 8, without ledge (for Gym), Silver Frame Best-Rite 2028H UltraTrim with Silver Frame $363.70 $40.00
Whiteboard, 4 x 8, without ledge (for Gym), Black Frame Best-Rite 2029H UltraTrim with Black Frame $363.70 $40.00
Whiteboard, 4 x 10, magnetic with alum frame LCS 2410 $637.60 $50.00
Whiteboard, 4 x 10, magnetic with alum frame Claridge 830L $615.00 $50.00
Whiteboard, 4 x 12, magnetic with alum frame Claridge 834L $718.00 $50.00
Whiteboard, 4' x 10", Non-Magnetic Best-Rite 212AK $402.90 $50.00
Whiteboard, 4' x 12', Non-Magnetic Best-Rite 212AM $469.00 $50.00
Whiteboard, 4' x 16", Magnetic Best-Rite 202AP $896.25 $50.00
Whiteboard, 4' x 16', Non-Magnetic Best-Rite 212AP $713.60 $50.00
Whitehoard/Bulietin Beard, 4 x 10, with alumunum frame LCS 5410 $623.90 $50.00
Whiteboard, Music Staff Lines, 3 x 4, w/ 3 sets of 5 lines Claridge LCS2034 $385.00 $40.00
Whiteboard, Music Staff Lines, on wheels, 3 x 4, aluminum frame Claridge LCS 155, casters add one $650.00
Whiteboard, Music Staff Lines, 4 x 6, Magnetic Best Rite 202AG-51 $659.30 $40.00
Whiteboard, Music Staff Lines, 4 x 8, Magnetic Best Rite 202AH-51 $743.10 $40.00
Workstation, Adjustable Height, 24-32" adj legs, 24 x 60" Abco CFLAA2460 $344.90
Workstation, Adjustable Height, 24-32" adj legs, 24 x 72" Abco CFLAA2472 $375.00
Casters for workstations above, 3" ABCO "C" $38.10
Additional ltems Added For Your Consideration
Desk, Teachers with Center Drawer Arico Bell #DAB0 30 x 48 $389.00
Desk, Teachers with Center Drawer Artco Bell #D500 30 x 60 $495.00
File Cabinet 2 Drawer Letter File with Lock Global #26-201 $147.60
File Cabinet 4 Drawer Letter File with Lock Global #26-401 $199.00
File Cabinet 5 Drawer Letter File with Lock Global #26-501 $289.00

File Cabinet 4 Drawer Legal File with Lock

Global #26-451

$232.00




